
1. Section 73 Certificate Required 
 

A Section 73 Compliance Certificate, under the Sydney Water Act 1994 must 
be obtained from Sydney Water Corporation. 
 
Application must be made through an authorised Water Servicing Co-ordinator. 
Please refer to the Building Developing and Plumbing section of the web site 
www.sydneywater.com.au then refer to “Water Servicing Co-ordinator” under 
“Developing Your Land” or telephone 13 20 92 for assistance. 
 
Following application a “Notice of Requirements” will advise of water and sewer 
infrastructure to be built and charges to be paid. Please make early contact 
with the Co-ordinator, as it can take some time to build water/sewer pipes and 
this may impact on other services and building, driveway or landscape design. 
 
The Section 73 Certificate must be submitted to the Principal Certifying 
Authority before occupation of Stage 1 of the development. 

 
2. Works-As-Executed Plans for Stormwater Drainage 
 

Prior to occupation of Stage 1 of the development, Works-As-Executed 
drawings signed by a registered surveyor demonstrating that the stormwater 
drainage and finished ground levels have been constructed as approved shall 
be submitted to the Principal Certifying Authority. 

 
3. On Site Detention – Works-As-Executed  
 

On completion of the drainage works and prior tooccupation of Stage 1 of the 
development, , Works-As-Executed plans certified by a Registered Surveyor 
are to be submitted to the Principal Certifying Authority to verify that the 
drainage works have been completed in accordance with the approved plans.  
The following details are to be on the Works-As-Executed plans and shall be 
marked in red on a copy of the original plan approved at the Construction 
Certificate stage. 
 
a. Sufficient levels and dimensions to verify the On-Site Detention storage 

volumes. 
 
b. Location and surface levels of all drainage pits, weir levels and 

dimensions. 
 

c. Invert levels of  - the internal drainage lines. 
 - orifice plates. 

 - outlet control pit. 
 
d. Finished floor levels of structures such as units and garages. 
 
e. Verification that the orifice plates have been fitted and the diameter of the 

fitted plates. 
 



f. Verification that a trash screen is installed. 
 

g. Location and levels of any overland flow paths through the site. 
 

h. Details of any variations made from approved plans. 
 
4. On-Site Detention – Certification of Works 
 

A Certificate shall be issued to the Principal Certifying Authority upon 
completion of the drainage works and prior to occupation of Stage 1 of the 
development, certifying the following: 
 
i. That the on-site detention system will function in accordance with the 

approved drainage design. 
 
ii. Any variations from the approved drainage design. 

 
iii. That these variations will not impair the performance of the On-Site 

Detention system, or alternatively provide details of the remedial works 
required to make the system function according to design control 
standards. 

 
 


